
 

 

TRAVANCORE DEVASWOM BOARD  
WORKS DEPARTMENT 

 

ASSISTANT ENGINEER’S OFFICE, ALUVA 

aetdbaluva@gmail.com 

NOTICE INVITING SHORT QUOTATIONS 
Competitive sealed and separate quotations are invited by the undersigned on behalf 

of the Travancore Devaswom Board from registered civil contractors of the Travancore 

Devaswom Board. 

Last date/time of receipt of 

filled up quotation forms       :04.03.2021 upto10.30 am 

Date and time of opening of quotation            : 04.03.2021 upto11.00am 

Class of contractor      :D class and above 

Sl 
No 

Quotati
on No 

Name of work PAC Rs. E M D 
Rs. 

 

Compl
etion 

period 

 1 
 
 
 
 

ALU/01
/21-22 

 

Aluva Mahadevar devaswom paravu r group-

Providing bio-toilet  to manalpuram in 

connection with Mahasivarathry festival in 

1196 ME 
  

 

Rs.54,000 Rs.1400  
 
7 days 

 
 
 

2 ALU/02
/21-22 

 

Aluva Mahadevar devaswom paravur 
group- Cleaning the Manalpuram  in 
connection with Mahashivaratri festival in 
1196 ME 

Rs.1,22,17
9 

Rs.3100 7 days 

3 ALU/03
/21-22 

 

Aluva Mahadevar devaswom- Paravur group-
Supplying medicated drinking water in 
connection with Sivarathry festival in 1196 ME 

Rs.49,555 Rs.1300 7 days 

4 ALU/04
/21-22 

 

Aluva Mahadevar devaswom paravur group- 
Removing heaps of Asthies from 
Asthinimanjanakadavu and cleaning the bathing 
ghat in connection with Mahashivaratri festival 
in 1196 ME 

Rs.1,10571 Rs.2800 7 days 

mailto:aetdbaluva@gmail.com


 

 

5 ALU/05
/21-22 

 

Aluva Mahadevar devaswom- Paravur group-
Providing  pandal for  vazhipadu and prasadam 
distribution counter  and  steel and traffic 
barricade in connection with Sivarathry festival 
in 1196 ME 

Rs.2,35,779 Rs.5900 7 days  

6 ALU/06
/21-22 

 

Aluva Mahadevar Devaswom- Paravur group- 
Certain urgent facilities in connection with 
Sivarathri in 1196 ME 

Rs.8994 Rs.300 7 days  

7 ALU/07
/21-22 

 

Aluva Mahadevar devaswom- Paravur group- 
Screening with bamboo mat outside 
chuttambalam and balikkalpura in connection 
with MahaSivarathri festival in 1196 ME 

Rs.50,504 Rs.1300 7 days 

 

The EMD should be in the form of Deposit receipt from any of the Nationalised / 

scheduled banks pledged in favour of the Executive Engineer, Travancore Devaswom Board, 

Kottayam . The undersigned reserves the right to accept or reject the quotation without 

assigning any reason. All other conditions / rules in respect of inviting quotations are the 

same as those currently prevailing in this department. Details are available from this office 

during office hours on all working days. 

 

 

Office of the Assistant Engineer      

Aluva         sd/-         

01.03.2021        Assistant Engineer 

Aluva 


